Jerry Wilcox

From: Clint Simmons <simmonsinsuranceservices@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, June 12, 2023 8:07 PM

To: Jerry Wilcox

Subject: Re: Claim

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Completed

Jerry:

Fred and | had a chance to speak this afternoon and Fred felt a 15% depreciation was very generous and he
said if it was him he would take the money. Especially coming from Dairyland, a payment of 85% seems
reasonable in an indemnification claim that requires the insurance company to only pay ACV. Also, Fred
mentioned, if the shoe was on the other foot and the city destroyed another person's property, the city's
insurance (LARM) would never settle with replacement cost rather ACV.

Thanks
Clint Simmons

On Mon, Jun 12, 2023 at 5:08 PM Jerry Wilcox <jerry.wilcox@crete.ne.gov> wrote:

| sent it as an Exchange file, so you may not be able to open. Here is PDF.

Jerry Wilcox | Clerk-Treasurer

City of Crete | 243 East 13 Street
Crete, NE | 68333

7 402 826-4313 | & 402 826-4334

“ijerry.wilcox@crete.ne.gov
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From: Clint Simmons <simmonsinsuranceservices@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, June 12, 2023 4:56 PM

To: Jerry Wilcox <jerry.wilcox@crete.ne.gov>

Cc: Wendy Thomas <wendy.thomas@crete.ne.gov>

Subject: Re: Claim

| don't see any email chain. Could you send that to me?

On Mon, Jun 12, 2023 at 4:14 PM Jerry Wilcox <jerry.wilcox@crete.ne.gov> wrote:

Clint,

Here is the information on the claim we spoke of on the phone:
e Invoice to Viking Insurance

e Letter from Dairyland
e Tapco equipment costs

| have also included the email chain related to this claim.

| did not send the accident report or pictures to Dairyland t any point, but did get them from PD for you today.

Let me know if there is any other information you might require.

Jerry Wilcox | Clerk-Treasurer

City of Crete | 243 East 13 Street
Crete, NE | 68333

7 402 826-4313 | & 402 826-4334

“ijerry.wilcox@crete.ne.gov
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Thank You

Clint Simmons
Simmons Insurance Services
308-380-1419

** EXTERNAL EMAIL. Is this an expected email? STOP and THINK before clicking links or opening

Thank You
Clint Simmons

Simmons Insurance Services
308-380-1419

** EXTERNAL EMAIL. Is this an expected email? STOP and THINK before clicking links or opening




